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Day 1: Aswan sightseeing tours on Friday

Cairo Top Tours offers transportation from Aswan Airport or Aswan Train Station to the MS Mayfair Nile
Cruise where you will be staying. Before lunch, your guide will accompany you on Aswan Day Tours,
starting with a visit to the renowned Aswan High Dam and the Temple of Isis, also known as the Temple of
Philae, situated on a picturesque island in Aswan. You will also have the opportunity to enjoy a relaxing
felucca ride along the Nile River in Aswan.

In the afternoon, the captain will welcome you aboard with a refreshing drink, and you can indulge in
afternoon tea. Dinner will be served on the cruise, providing a delightful dining experience.

Meals included: Lunch, Dinner

Day 2: Saturday - Visits to the Edfu and Kom Ombo Temples

During your Nile River cruise in Egypt, you will start the day with a delightful breakfast. The cruise will then
take you to Kom Ombo, where you will have the opportunity to explore the Kom Ombo templeis a small
town located in Upper Egypt, specifically on the east bank of the Nile River. It is situated about 40
kilometers north of Aswan and 165 kilometers south of Luxor. The town is famous for its unique temple, the
Kom Ombo Temple, which is dedicated to two ancient Egyptian deities: Sobek, the crocodile god, and
Horus, the falcon-headed god.

Afterward, you will be transported by horse carriage to visit the Temple of Horus in Edfu another ancient
Egyptian town located on the west bank of the Nile River, between Luxor and Aswan in Upper Egypt.
Following the visit, the cruise will continue, allowing you to savor your meals while taking in the
breathtaking views of the Nile River.

In the evening, an Egyptian Galabiya party will be organized for your enjoyment. You will spend the night in
Esna.

Meals included: Breakfast, Lunch, Dinner

Day 3: Sunday - Tours of the East Bank of Luxor

As the sun rises, you will sail towards Luxor, relishing a delightful breakfast on board. Once you arrive in
Luxor, your Luxor Day Tours will commence with a visit to the East Bank of the Nile. You will explore the
magnificent Temple of Luxor another remarkable ancient Egyptian temple located in the city of Luxor, which
was known as Thebes in antiquity., as well as the grand Karnak Temple dedicated to the deities Amun and
Mut. Afterward, you will return to your cruise ship to indulge in a delicious lunch on board. In the evening,
you can look forward to dinner accompanied by enchanting music on the Egypt Nile River Cruise. You will
spend the night in Luxor, preparing for more adventures to come.

Meals included: Breakfast, Lunch, Dinner

https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/Aswan-Attractions---Things-to-do-in-Aswan/The-High-Dam
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/Aswan-Attractions---Things-to-do-in-Aswan/Philae-Temple
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/Aswan-Attractions---Things-to-do-in-Aswan/Philae-Temple
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/Aswan-Attractions---Things-to-do-in-Aswan/Kom-Ombo-Temple
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/Aswan-Attractions---Things-to-do-in-Aswan/The-Temple-of-Horus-at--Edfu
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Day-Tours-and-Excursions/Luxor-Day-Tours-and-Sightseeing
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/Luxor-Attractions---Things-to-do-in-Luxor/Luxor-temple
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/Luxor-Attractions---Things-to-do-in-Luxor/Karnak-Temple


Day 4: Disembarkation on Monday after Luxor West Bank
Tours.

Enjoy a delicious breakfast on board before disembarking at 8:00 to begin your West Bank tours in Luxor.
Your first stop will be the renowned Valley of the Kings, where you can explore the ancient tombs of
pharaohs. Next, you will proceed to the Temple of Deir El Bahari, a remarkable structure built for the
extraordinary Queen Hatshepsut, the only female pharaoh in Egyptian history. She exhibited exceptional
qualities and even assumed the role typically held by men. Lastly, you will have the opportunity to capture
some memorable pictures amidst the ruins of the colossal statues of Amenhotep III, famously known as the
Colossi of Memnon are two massive stone statues located on the west bank of the Nile River near the modern
city of Luxor in Egypt.

Once your Egypt Nile Cruise Tours come to an end, you will be transferred to your preferred drop-off
location as per your request.

Meals included: Breakfast

https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/Luxor-Attractions---Things-to-do-in-Luxor/Valley-of-the-Kings
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/Kings-and-Rulers-of-Egypt/Queen-Hatshepsut-
https://www.cairotoptours.com/Egypt-Travel-Guide/Luxor-Attractions---Things-to-do-in-Luxor/Colossi-of-Memnon

